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 LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF ONTARIO ASSEMBLÉE LÉGISLATIVE DE L’ONTARIO 

STANDING COMMITTEE ON 
PUBLIC ACCOUNTS 

COMITÉ PERMANENT DES 
COMPTES PUBLICS 

 Thursday 31 March 2005 Jeudi 31 mars 2005 

The committee met at 0935 in room 1, following a 
closed session. 

2004 ANNUAL REPORT, 
PROVINCIAL AUDITOR 

MINISTRY OF TRANSPORTATION 
Consideration of section 3.14, maintenance of the 

provincial highway system. 
The Chair (Mr. Norman W. Sterling): Welcome to 

the committee. The committee will be sitting until 1 
o’clock, and then we will sit after question period, if 
necessary. It hasn’t been necessary to date, and I 
wouldn’t anticipate that to be the case today, but who 
knows where it will go. Deputy Rafi, do you want to 
introduce those people who are with you? Perhaps just 
Carl, who is sitting with you. If you require the input of 
other people, you can introduce them as they come 
forward. If you have some opening remarks, we’d invite 
you to give those now. 

Mr. Saäd Rafi: Thank you, Chair. First off, good 
morning, Mr. Chair and members of the standing com-
mittee on public accounts. As the Chair has mentioned, 
my name’s Saäd Rafi. I’m the deputy minister of 
transportation. To my left is Carl Hennum, our assistant 
deputy minister of the provincial highway management 
division. We have four staff with us who, as the Chair 
suggests, I will introduce if we require their assistance. 
I’d like to thank you for this opportunity to discuss the 
Auditor General’s report and our responses and improve-
ments associated with it. I’d also like to thank the 
Auditor General for his many positive recommendations, 
which will help us achieve, I think, many more higher 
levels of performance in the ministry and for the highway 
corridor. 

The Auditor General recognized the progress that has 
been made in improving maintenance procedures since 
1999, when the last provincial audit was done in this 
area. This process has allowed us to examine how we can 
continue to improve the cost efficiency and effectiveness 
of our maintenance measures while ensuring our high-
ways and bridges are safe and well maintained. We take 
these recommendations very seriously, and I’m pleased 
to report that we’re taking action on or have already 
implemented all of the report’s recommendations. 

Our ultimate goal is to make Ontario roads safer. 
According to the latest Ontario Road Safety Annual 

Report, we have the safest roads in North America. How-
ever, we’re committed to continually improving on our 
record. Our ministry is a recognized leader in highway 
management practices, and a number of other juris-
dictions come here to learn from us. Nevertheless, we are 
continually striving to improve our performance by 
providing leading-edge maintenance technology and 
developing a world-class and cost-efficient asset manage-
ment framework. 

This morning I’d like to focus my remarks on three 
key areas: the managing of maintenance contracts, meas-
uring and reporting on performance, and asset manage-
ment. I’ll begin with managing maintenance contracts. 

The Auditor General’s report recommends that in 
order to manage maintenance contracts more effectively, 
the ministry should provide coordinators with more 
specific guidelines so they can perform their inspections 
more effectively. I’d like to thank the auditor for this 
recommendation, which highlights something that we 
take very seriously: our stewardship of a vital provincial 
asset and the importance of monitoring the quality of our 
contractors’ work. 

The ministry has detailed guidelines for our coor-
dinators to provide direction for consistent and unbiased 
monitoring. Contract administrators undergo a compre-
hensive training program, and a refresher course for con-
tract monitors is currently under development to provide 
updated instruction on new and revised processes. But as 
the auditor has correctly pointed out, the ministry needs 
to and will work toward continually improving its ability 
to manage maintenance contractors by making inspection 
guidelines more specific. We are currently reviewing our 
monitoring priorities, frequency, documentation and the 
reporting of our results. Methods made possible by 
advanced technology will also be examined and the 
results of this review will be incorporated into an update 
of our monitoring manual, and also into the maintenance 
contract administrator refresher courses that we provide. 
We expect this work to be completed by March of next 
year. 

The auditor also recommended that the ministry im-
plement systems for managing and analyzing data for 
inspections, violations, complaints and claims for 
damages by highway users, along with the service levels 
that we achieve. We thank the auditor for this timely 
recommendation, as new technology and systems for 
managing and analyzing data are now becoming avail-
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able to us. For the past two years, we’ve been actively 
conducting field trials of a global positioning system, or 
GPS, and Internet-enabled mobile electronic diaries that 
were referred to in the auditor’s report to record and 
provide key information to contract administrators. 
0940 

Our commitment is to making Ontario’s roads even 
safer, despite the fact that traffic volumes have continued 
to increase. For example, traffic on our provincial high-
ways increased by over 5.3 billion vehicle kilometres 
between 1998 and 2002, yet the number of fatalities per 
10,000 licensed drivers declined by 6.3%. We’re very 
proud of that. 

In his report, the auditor also recommended that MTO 
take such steps as reviewing regional procedures and 
records to ensure fairness and consistency across the 
province of the sanctions we applied to contractors for 
violations. I want to thank the auditor for his recom-
mendation on this important issue. We take the matter of 
violations extremely seriously, and so do our contractors, 
as it affects their ability to secure future work. 

We are proud of our contractors and the work they do, 
both in their consistency of delivery and in their adher-
ence to standards. Our contract administrators are trained 
in dealing with non-conformance and the imposition of 
sanctions. If a contractor fails to meet the terms of a 
contract, we have a protocol in place that provides clear 
direction on how sanctions are to be applied, and poten-
tial sanctions are set out in the language of each contract. 
Regional management then reviews the appropriateness 
of the sanction and, finally, head office staff are available 
for consultation if the violation is unusual or indeed com-
plicated. 

Currently, the ministry uses data from a variety of 
sources to establish inspection frequencies and monitor 
contract performance. We have a database of contract 
violations that is updated every month, and we are active-
ly exploring ways to ensure consistency across the prov-
ince in both our procedures and our decisions. In 
addition, to respond to the recommendation, we are im-
plementing a centralized database to continuously track 
sanctions and create review processes, including a more 
formalized head office role. This additional review will 
strengthen provincial consistency and fairness in apply-
ing our sanctions. 

I’d like to move now to measuring and reporting on 
performance, beginning with the impact of salt use on 
our environment, a very critical issue. The Auditor 
General recommended that in order to identify and better 
manage the impact of salt use in our environment, the 
ministry should take the necessary steps to properly 
monitor salt use and work with the Ministry of the 
Environment to establish ongoing testing and tracking of 
the impact of salt. Our environmental responsibility is 
important to us. We’re constantly working to refine our 
technology and to better monitor salt use. Ontario is 
recognized as a national leader in salt management best 
practices and has actively participated in the Environ-

ment Canada multi-stakeholder working group on this 
very subject. 

We’re always looking at new winter maintenance 
technologies that will help us improve salt management 
and safety, such as the development and implementation 
of automatic vehicle location systems, or AVL. AVL 
provides real-time, accurate information, such as the 
location of our plows and our spreaders and the amount 
of salt they put down on the highway. We are continuing 
to refine this AVL technology, and we are developing a 
system of automated reports that will help improve salt 
use monitoring, as recommended. In addition to AVL 
technology, we have deployed something called ARWIS, 
which is the advanced road weather information system, 
now for several years. This allows for computerized 
spreader controls, the pre-wetting of various mixtures 
that are applied to the highway and infrared thermom-
eters to ensure that the appropriate amount of salt is 
applied, therefore benefiting the environment. Lastly, we 
are working with the Ministry of the Environment on a 
new environmental monitoring project, which is intended 
to demonstrate the impact of reduced salt use. This is to 
be completed in the fall of this year. 

The ministry and the auditor both recognize the need 
to provide the most efficient and effective delivery of 
highway services. The ministry agrees with the auditor 
that in order to make the best use of funds, our prioritiz-
ation process should allow preservation and prevention 
methods to compete with all other projects for funding 
based on a full cost-benefit analysis. To this end, we are 
currently implementing the asset management business 
framework, which will allow for a more consistent means 
to prioritize all our highway investments. We have shown 
leadership amongst North American transportation agen-
cies in the development of this very framework. 

With this implementation, we can apply a consistent 
and very long-term view for highway management. This 
framework allows us to make the right investments in the 
right place at the right time. It encompasses all infra-
structure assets and all phases of the investment cycle, 
from planning to construction to maintenance. This will 
help us improve the condition of our highway infra-
structure and deliver greater cost efficiencies, along with 
increased justification for the dollars spent. Additionally, 
it provides timely and reliable information and greater 
public accountability. We’re moving away from a “worst 
first” approach to a full-life-cycle costing approach in 
rehabilitating our highways. This allows flexibility in the 
treatment of assets. Less expensive treatments can be 
applied and used in rehabilitation earlier, thereby reduc-
ing the overall cost and extending the life of the pave-
ment. 

The ministry has concentrated expertise and effort in 
this area for a number of years, developing and imple-
menting world-class technical analysis and tools for 
highway management. In his report, the Auditor General 
also recommended that the bridge management system 
should contain complete and accurate information, in-
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cluding details of recent structural maintenance work, 
and that key aspects of each structure must be inspected. 

It is noteworthy that the Canadian highway bridge 
design code is based on the Ontario highway bridge 
design code, which was developed by the ministry. In 
addition, Quebec, Nova Scotia and Saskatchewan use the 
Ontario structure inspection manual for bridge and 
culvert inspections. We’re understandably proud of that. 
We provide this bridge management system, or BMS, to 
Ontario municipalities through the Ontario Good Roads 
Association at no cost to them. The city of Toronto is 
currently in the process of implementing this very 
system.  

While we are confident in the reliability of the BMS, 
we agree with the importance of continually improving 
our processes. We’re currently reviewing the data in this 
system to modify it to address the report’s recommen-
dations. It was recommended that the BMS automatically 
generate a report on all overdue bridge inspections. We 
are currently modifying the system to ensure that a 
notification flag, if inspection reports are not filed every 
two years, comes to our attention.  

We remain totally committed to working with our 
municipal colleagues and providing them with the tools, 
such as the bridge management system, to help them 
improve management of their roads and bridges. The 
ministry has led the establishment of a joint working 
group, made up of the Ontario Good Roads Association, 
who represent approximately 90% of Ontario municipal-
ities, and the Ministries of Public Infrastructure Renewal 
and Municipal Affairs and Housing, to create a municipal 
asset management database for roads and bridges.  

We also continue to make municipalities aware of 
their bridge inspection responsibilities through federal-
provincial funding programs such as the previous Ontario 
small town and rural infrastructure fund, also known as 
OSTAR, and, most recently, under the Canada-Ontario 
municipal-rural infrastructure fund, known as COMRIF. 
Under COMRIF, a request for information is included in 
the application, asking municipalities to indicate that they 
have an asset management system and bridge inspection 
data in place. 

We’re working with the federal government, our part-
ner in this program, to ensure a portion of the COMRIF 
funds is allocated to the development of asset manage-
ment capabilities amongst municipalities. The auditor 
recommended that the ministry implement performance 
measures dealing with the condition of assets under 
management and the cost effectiveness with which 
resources have been employed to manage the province’s 
highway system, and to report annually on those results.  

I’m proud to say that we are improving our efforts in 
this regard. Certainly, performance measures have been 
used for many years in MTO. For example, for the pave-
ment, bridge and maintenance offices, we have monitor-
ing systems in place that report on data collected on an 
annual basis, including time to get to bare pavement after 
winter storms, and on pavement and bridge conditions. 

The auditor recognized the current work being done 
on performance measures through the implementation of 
our asset management framework, which I mentioned 
earlier. This emphasizes appropriate management 
decision-making, and it will help us meet the auditor’s 
recommendations. We have other measures under 
consideration in this framework, such as looking at how 
we value the assets and how we look at the remaining 
service life of our assets.  

Also in response to the auditor’s recommendation, we 
are currently working on developing a quarterly report to 
provide the status of activities that will affect our per-
formance measures. In addition, we are developing 
training programs in the use of all asset management 
tools, including performance measures for all our staff.  

A new integrated inventory monitoring system is also 
in development that will enable more current and auto-
mated comparative analysis and reporting. The ministry 
will also implement the auditor’s comments on contract 
administrator documentation through annual updates to 
our inspection manuals, our contract officer manuals and 
the consultant performance appraisal system that we use 
to judge our consultants. 

To conclude my remarks today, let me once again 
thank the Auditor General for his recommendations, and 
also the Chair for the opportunity to present to the 
standing committee on public accounts. Although we are 
proud of our performance and of our professional and 
dedicated staff, we recognize that there’s always more 
that can be achieved. Our commitment is to continual im-
provement, and by continually examining and adopting 
the best and most cost-effective design, construction, 
maintenance and highway management practices, On-
tario will continue to provide leadership in highway 
infrastructure management and deliver maximum value 
to Ontario taxpayers. Most importantly, we’ll keep On-
tario’s roads the safest in North America, as is our hope.  

Again, thank you for the opportunity to address the 
Auditor General’s report. We’ll be happy to take 
questions. 

The Chair: OK. Do we have any questions? Julia. 
0950 

Mrs. Julia Munro (York North): Thank you very 
much for coming here this morning. I wanted to ask a 
question that relates to the first part of your presentation 
on the issue of the maintenance contracts. In the auditor’s 
report, it details the manner in which the contract 
administrator is able to impose sanctions where required. 
I wanted to ask you a question with regard to that. Do 
they improve? Are these relatively oversight kinds of 
situations? 

The reason I wanted to know was the issue, then, of 
not renewing a contract at some point because of the 
sanctions. What kind of experience have you had in that 
whole area of how well they respond to the sanction 
issue? Do you have to not renew contracts because of it? 
I wonder if you could give us a sense of that process and 
how effective it is. 
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Mr. Rafi: Sure. At a general level, anyhow—and I’ll 
ask Carl to address some of the types of sanctions we 
apply—our contractors’ performance has been, I think, 
examined by the auditor and found to be in high 
compliance with the standards that we set for them. We 
do believe that that is actually a function not just of LAC 
standards but of their adherence and of our experience 
over several years in that regard with them. 

There is a demerit point system that we use for 
sanctions that allows us to increase the demerits, which 
has a financial penalty. We would obviously look at 
public safety as the ultimate concern that we would have. 
We’re quite pleased to be able to say that we don’t have 
examples of public safety being compromised, but, of 
course, depending on severe weather conditions or what 
have you, they may not meet the threshold standard each 
and every hour of their requirements. 

To give you an indication of some of the specifics, 
perhaps I’ll ask Carl to respond. 

Mr. Carl Hennum: In the contracts, as the deputy 
explained, we have pre-set schedules for what happens if 
the contractor does not meet our requirements. These 
could be points that accumulate up to a certain level, or it 
could, in fact, be financial penalties. Yes, we have 
applied these on a regular basis. I’m happy to say that we 
are quite impressed with the performance of our con-
tractors, quite frankly, but things do happen. 

The penalties or the points are for a whole range of 
types of shortcomings that could be anything from not 
keeping proper records, for example, to not showing up 
on time for a snowstorm, or using the wrong material on 
the highway for anti-icing and de-icing purposes and so 
on. So we have applied these on a regular basis. The 
contractors take these things very carefully. 

As you know, we have a competitive environment for 
awarding our contracts, and they operate on probably not 
a very generous margin, because there is keen com-
petition out there. So penalties such as financial penalties 
are taken very seriously. In addition, of course, we have 
discussions with them about what they’re going to do in 
order to prevent these things from occurring again. I can 
guarantee to you, they don’t take these things lightly, and 
they have some very serious discussions with us as to the 
fairness and consistency in the way we apply these 
things. So far, we have not gotten to the stage where we 
have contemplated any break of any contracts or refusal 
to renew contracts. 

Mrs. Munro: Given what you have said with regard 
to what I would agree with, that people would want to 
take those very seriously, my second question, then, has 
to do with the issue—and you have just alluded to this, 
but I’d like a further conversation about it—of the 
competition and the fact that this process does depend on 
a healthy, competitive environment. I wondered if you 
could comment for us on whether you see any challenges 
with retaining that healthy, competitive environment. Ob-
viously, in this particular area, as is the case with many 
others, there are huge capital investments required for 
anyone to contemplate being part of the competitive 

process. It would seem to me that you might have some 
parts of the province where this is a healthier environ-
ment than others. I just wondered if you could comment 
on this, because I do think it’s a very, very important part 
of the province’s ability to maintain the kind of standards 
that you’re looking at. 

Mr. Rafi: We have actually gone through another 
round of competitive tenders for areas that have come up 
for renewal throughout the province. Whether it’s in less 
populated areas of the province or more densely 
populated highway networks within the province, we’ve 
been very pleased to see a healthy environment. We have 
seen the willingness of companies to come with their bids 
in the blind, sealed approach that we have, with numer-
ous companies applying for each and every contract. 
There is competition. If a company didn’t get the last 
one, they are sharpening their pencil, and that’s creating a 
benefit to the taxpayer by lower bid prices for these jobs 
and these contracts, as well as investment in equipment. 
Some companies are, at the beginning of a contract, 
identifying that they’re investing in brand new equipment 
that they will capitalize over the life of the contract. We 
have aided that—investment as well as competition—by 
having varying lengths of contracts so that they can bid 
on a five-year, seven-year or nine-year schedule and we 
can prepare prices across those schedules and take the 
best price for us. It allows them to decide how they want 
to capitalize certain assets, what the age of their 
equipment is and so on. So it’s allowed us to maintain a 
healthy, competitive environment and not to have to 
make capital investment in equipment. 

Mrs. Munro: To me, this would be the key factor in 
terms of being able to continue. There are those com-
panies, then, that are still looking at being able to get in 
on the next round, so to speak, and it very much is 
dependent on that. 

I hear the area of responsibility for a coordinator 
talked about, but would you also make some of the con-
tracts different sizes in terms of being able to attract dif-
ferent competitors? Is that part of your planning process? 

Mr. Hennum: In the first round of contracts we 
typically had what we call the clusters of the area main-
tenance contracts, which sort of let the contractors bid on 
one of them, two of them or all three of them. We would 
then compare the best combined price of all these and 
pick the ones that would give us the best return on our 
investment, so to speak. We have continued that in some 
cases as well in the second round. 

I should also mention to you that we do have two 
types of contracts out there. One is what we call the area 
maintenance contract, where the contractor manages the 
process and does all the work, and we just do the quality 
assurance. The other type of contract is what we call the 
managed outsourcing contract, where we actually do the 
management but use contractors to do all the work. These 
contracts are smaller contracts on a functional basis. 
Typically it may be one contract for winter maintenance 
in an area, it may be one contract for pothole patching, it 
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may be one for other things like patching or short 
resurfacing contracts, that sort of thing. 

In addition, I should say, with respect to your concern 
about the smaller groups, in the area of maintenance 
contracts the contractors typically have subcontractors, 
which then allows the industry in general to access our 
work out there. 

But you’re quite right; one of the most important 
pieces for the success of outsourcing is to maintain the 
competitive element, and I think we have been extremely 
successful in doing that. We keep a close eye on the 
tendering process and the award process to make sure we 
are proactive in that regard. 
1000 

The Chair: The Provincial Auditor wanted to add a 
comment. 

Mr. Jim McCarter: We did look at that. We were 
concerned, especially in the less populated areas, whether 
you had a situation where you only had maybe two 
bidders, and it’s like, “Bob, you take this one; I’ll take 
the next one.” We actually found, Mrs. Munro, that they 
had at least three bidders for all the contracts. We were 
certainly satisfied that it was a good, competitive process. 

The Chair: From the Liberal caucus, I have David 
Zimmer, Ms. Sandals and Mr. Lalonde, and now I have 
Bill as well. 

Mr. David Zimmer (Willowdale): I gather that the 
past history of how the money gets passed out at the 
ministry is that it has essentially been by envelope fund-
ing, and this new asset management business framework 
is to enable you to work out some priorities rather than 
just your envelope funding. Is the asset management 
business framework going to prioritize within an en-
velope or is it a global prioritization? 

Mr. Rafi: Given your juxtaposition, I would suggest 
that it’s a global look at the province’s assets, to manage 
them on multiple indices. It’s really a business process 
whereby we are using everything from corridor plans in 
each region of the province’s highway network, segment 
by segment, to have an assessment of the asset state and 
to then apply various business measures to determine 
what levels of rehabilitation you need to spend money on 
at what time. It gives us an overall picture of the asset at 
any point in time. Frankly, it has been deemed as the 
most sophisticated approach to valuing, addressing and 
maintaining what is a significant investment, and built-up 
investment over time, in the asset network. It isn’t really 
looking at, “You get a certain amount for this region, this 
region and that region,” as much as it’s saying, “Where 
do we best apply funds to ensure preservation of the asset 
as well as expansion?” That is a balance that has to be 
struck and has to be struck most effectively. 

Mr. Zimmer: But to date it has essentially been 
envelope funding, so are there two processes to prioritize 
within the envelope and is there another process to move 
money from one envelope to another? Thirdly, if the 
decision is to move money on a priority basis from one 
envelope to another, how quickly are you able to do that? 

Mr. Hennum: Essentially the asset management 
process we’re putting in place is a planning process, a 
management process, a decision process, and it will 
provide us with better information as input to the budget-
ing process, which in turn creates the envelopes you’re 
talking about. The envelopes basically will allow the 
government to track the various types of investments 
they make. The process we’re putting in place is to en-
hance the advice that we can give with respect to where 
to make the best possible investments. The funding, 
hopefully, will be influenced by that and created on the 
basis of where the best strategies lie in order to maintain 
a certain piece of highway or the overall network itself. 

Mr. Zimmer: Is it safe to say, then, that in fact we’re 
moving away from envelope financing? 

Mr. Hennum: I don’t know if it’s really important 
whether they give us funding in certain envelopes as long 
as they have the right information from us to create those 
envelopes in the first place. That information will look at 
all the possible strategies for maintaining a piece of high-
way, whether it’s expansion for certain reasons, rehabili-
tation or preservation types of projects, to maintain the 
highways while we’re waiting for the level of deterior-
ation required for full rehabilitation.  

Mr. Rafi: If I might just try to expand on that, to try 
to address your question, on the matter of envelope 
funding, I don’t think I’d characterize our funding in that 
way actually. What I would suggest is that we have our 
annual capital budgeting cycle with multi-year planning, 
so that it isn’t a matter of saying that you have X hundred 
million dollars for rehabilitation, and you figure out how 
you spend it that way. It’s far more detailed than that.  

What we’re providing on an annual basis to the capital 
plan, and then to cabinet for its approval, is a detailed 
assessment by highway corridor as to what is relevant for 
expansion and why, because of the economic aspects of 
these corridors; what is necessary for rehabilitation and 
maintenance and why. That’s where the manager frame-
work comes into play, because we can quite deliberately 
and in a detailed manner identify that a dollar spent today 
is saving X amount of dollars over the long term if we 
rehab now versus waiting. So if you want to call that an 
envelope-based approach, I would say that the size of the 
envelope, if you will, varies year over year, because 
they’re looking at it on a multi-year planning basis with 
annual budgeting approval. 

Mr. Zimmer: I guess my concern is—my experience 
has been that once money gets put into an envelope, it’s 
hard to get it out. It tends to stay there. And there’s a 
built-in incentive to use up the money in the envelope. 
My question is, on the new asset management business 
framework, how quickly are you able to move money 
from one envelope to another envelope in keeping with 
the overall asset management priority? 

Mr. Rafi: I would say that it’s as immediate as 
necessary. It’s the most transparent method of managing 
critical assets that one could have, because we have to be 
able to account for why we’re spending that money. It 
isn’t a matter of a gross amount, as I mentioned earlier: 
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“Let’s hurry up and burn that capital, because we’re 
coming to the end of the fiscal year.” That happens to 
apply for a few reasons, not the least of which is that 
we’re talking about highway capital expenditures, which 
are not quick expenditures. A commitment today will 
have a multi-year impact, because it will start with plan-
ning, design, construction, and then rehabilitation and 
maintenance.  

It’s unlike operating funds, where the ability to move 
money from within and to address priorities is there, but 
since we have a multi-year planning approach with 
individual life-cycle costing for individual segments, I 
think it’s not only transparent but it allows the govern-
ment to decide where it wants to put its emphasis. It also 
allows us to make the case properly and as significant to 
engineering standards as possible, to say, “This should be 
rehabilitated, this should be and so on.” 
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Mr. Zimmer: My last question: How is that actually 
done, if you find yourself in conflict with an envelope 
manager who has a compelling argument to use the 
funding in the envelope and you find that compelling 
argument is in conflict with the bigger asset management 
argument? What’s the process for sorting out that debate 
or resolving that conflict? 

Mr. Rafi: The debate doesn’t exist if you can’t prove 
the need for the funding, and the need for the funding 
starts fundamentally from an asset valuation, an asset 
assessment base. Secondly, we are constantly balancing 
the request for expenditure between expansion and re-
habilitation/maintenance. Obviously, given the fact that 
Canada is a strong trading nation and given the fact that 
the US is our border partner, the highways become key 
economic corridors. While we undertake expansion in 
certain areas—for example, Windsor—we are also under-
taking rehabilitation at the same time in some of those 
areas. Those prioritizations are balances and trade-offs 
that are made by the priorities that are set both economic-
ally and by the application of this asset management 
framework, which allows us to make critical choices that 
in the past were made based on, I would say, engineering 
expertise. Now it’s raised to the next level of expertise, 
business acumen, as well as need from an engineering 
point of view. 

Mr. Zimmer: Who’s the actual body or person or 
committee that resolves that conflict? There’s an envel-
ope, overall asset management conflict. Does the deputy 
do that? 

Mr. Rafi: No. Our plans are prepared, submitted to 
the minister for review, as you would likely know, and 
then we work with public infrastructure renewal, which 
manages the government’s capital expenditures across its 
entire enterprise. Those decisions are then assessed based 
on other priorities in other sectors and taken to cabinet 
for approval, and then we’re given our allocations, just as 
we are with operating expenditures, through our annual 
results-based planning. 

The Chair: We had approximately 10 minutes from 
Mrs. Munro and about 10 minutes from David Zimmer, 

so I’m going to give Mr. Prue 10 or so minutes to lead 
off and then we’ll go back through the rotation. 

Mr. Michael Prue (Beaches–East York): I don’t 
know that I need the whole 10 minutes. I’m most inter-
ested in the whole controversy around salt. Since you 
have in the past two years done all of these wonderful 
things that I’m reading about here, how much has ton-
nage gone down in Ontario? What’s the actual reduction 
in salt, or has there been any? 

Mr. Hennum: As you know, the amount of salt that 
we put down is highly dependent on what kind of winters 
we have. So you will not be able to find one trend; it 
depends on the severity of the winter, the frequency of 
snowfalls, temperature fluctuations. Typically we’d use 
more salt if it hovers around the zero mark, because you 
get freezing and thawing, for example. It’s a matter of the 
type of winters that we have; it’s variable. It’s difficult to 
compare from year to year, although we are at the 
moment developing what we call a winter severity index, 
together with other provinces in Canada and with the 
United States, and we’re trying to come up with the 
possibility of making those comparisons that you are 
referring to there. 

Mr. Rafi: In addition, we are trying to establish a goal 
of perhaps as high as a 20% reduction in overall salt 
usage. As Carl has indicated, there is huge variability in 
that. But ultimately, with some of the technology that 
we’ve put in place, the GPS and mobile AVL technology 
that I referred to in my remarks, we have a more accurate 
indication of both the spread of salt and also various 
techniques that we’ve applied, like pre-wetting of salt to 
ensure that it stays where it’s applied. So if I could say so 
in this manner, it isn’t just about how much, but about 
spread rates, amount of spread, its application and where 
it stays, so that environmental degradation is minimized 
as well. 

Mr. Prue: I’m from Toronto. I try to get out of 
Toronto in the wintertime because the snow here is all 
black. It’s not very nice. I’ve noticed in the city that they 
tend to do less plowing and more salting. Are we doing 
that in Ontario? Some of the side streets don’t get plowed 
any more since amalgamation; they get salted and salted 
again and salted again. I would have to think that the 
amount of salt being used in the city of Toronto is up 
hugely and the amount of plowing is down equally. Is 
that a phenomenon that is happening elsewhere around 
Ontario roads? 

Mr. Hennum: We use both plowing and salting, and 
sanding, for that matter. It just depends, of course, on the 
amount of snowfall and the temperatures as well. Salt can 
only be used down to a certain temperature and after that 
it’s not effective, so we would use sand in those situ-
ations. We do use snowplowing as one of our major 
activities. In fact, most of our equipment now is com-
bination units, with both a plow and a salt spreader on the 
trucks themselves. We are not proceeding with what’s 
sometimes referred to as the salt option, as you know, 
which is just trying to melt the snow in place. 
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Mr. Prue: All right. So this is happening more so in 
the city of Toronto than in Ontario itself, this whole use 
of salt as opposed to plowing? 

Mr. Hennum: I can’t speak for the city of Toronto. 
We don’t monitor their processes. 

Mr. Prue: Since you’ve started trying to use less salt, 
what has been the impact particularly on the bridges and 
the roads? Obviously, if you use less salt, there will be 
less rotting out of the infrastructure under the bridges. 
Again, using Toronto examples—I’m sorry; I’m just a 
boy from Toronto—the Gardiner Expressway had to be 
pulled down because it got too expensive. The salt 
completely destroyed that highway. Have we noticed any 
improvements on our bridges in Ontario if and when the 
salt has been reduced, which I’m not sure it has, from 
your answer? 

Mr. Hennum: I think there are improvements on our 
bridges, but I don’t think the main reason is the amount 
of salt we use. We have different standards for designing 
bridges these days than we had some 30 or 40 years ago. 

Mr. Prue: But half the bridges in Ontario are still 30 
or 40 years old. I drive over them too. They’re no 
different. 

Mr. Hennum: That’s right, but we’re talking about 
reductions. There’s still going to be salt on the bridges 
and if they reach, for example, the reinforcing steel on 
the bridge, they’re still going to start corrosion. So what 
we do instead is try to prevent that. For example, in areas 
on the structure that can be exposed to salt, we are using 
stainless steel in some cases, or we use coated rebars in 
some other areas. We also use a thicker cover of concrete 
over the rebars to prevent salt from seeping into the 
actual metal itself. We use different bridge deck sealing, 
and so, on to prevent that sort of thing. 

In the deterioration of the structure, it’s not so much 
the amount of salt as the fact that salt reaches these 
critical things like reinforcing steel. We have to design 
them in such a way that we prevent this from happening. 

Mr. Prue: I think that’s close enough to 10 minutes. 
Thank you very much. 

Mrs. Liz Sandals (Guelph–Wellington): Just to a 
note to Mr. Prue, that I can tell him that Guelph is less 
slushy than Toronto. I can actually tell you where the 
maintenance contracts change driving along the 401, 
because I can see the change in practice, which probably 
means I spend too much time driving up and down the 
401. 

I’d actually like to ask a couple of questions. One is 
about the internal audit that was done by MTO. Con-
gratulations to the ministry for doing this, and obviously 
sufficiently thoroughly that the auditor has just included 
your internal work in his report. But on page 353 it 
references the issue of the quality of work by design 
consultants. This is a particularly hot issue in Guelph, 
because we did have the instance of Hanlon Highway 6 
north, an interchange being built, where I take it, due to 
design flaws, construction actually had to stop. It had to 
be redesigned. Some of it had to be rebuilt. It was quite a 
fiasco. I’m wondering if you could tell me something 

about how that particular incident was addressed, if that’s 
appropriate, and then more generally, how do you 
monitor to avoid that sort of fiasco in the future? 
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Mr. Rafi: The specific incident that I believe you’re 
referring to, if I understand it correctly, is one of the rare 
circumstances where we’ve had to take legal remedies 
with the design consultant because we discovered that 
there was an error in the design. That is a rare circum-
stance. 

We’ve also, since our internal audit service, looked at 
the quality of work by design consultants. We’ve put in a 
few improvements to our current processes. I’d like to 
reference three of them. 

One is implementing an engineering project manage-
ment system, which will ensure that these designers have 
a sufficient amount of time for their projects. On occa-
sion, that can be an issue. 

Secondly, we’re looking at improving our estimating 
tools, and we’ve added a refresher course and training 
module, up to two days, on estimating for staff. We’ve 
sponsored approximately 15 courses in this area of cost 
estimating. 

The third area is to implement a system to track vari-
ous change orders, because of course if there are change 
orders, they’re likely associated with the initial design, 
and to determine how we can reduce change orders, 
which then has an impact on ensuring higher-quality 
design, which goes back to the first couple of changes 
we’ve made as well. 

In the main, I think the work that the design con-
sultants do is of a high calibre and is probably the more 
complex end of the business because one can’t look at 
every foot of the proposed road network that they’re 
designing. They have to take certain segments and sec-
tions and then extrapolate in that regard. 

We’re trying to take initial cost estimates, and before 
we put out the contract, we’re trying to have final 
estimates so that we can keep change orders and overall 
prices of construction within finer gradations of 5%, 
perhaps 10%. 

I think those measures will continue to see improve-
ments, and we’ll continue to try to improve the quality of 
our design as well, to speak to the specific issue you 
identified. 

Maybe you’d like to add something. 
Mr. Hennum: I just want to add that we do have a 

system now where all the consultants have to be pre-
qualified in their specific disciplines and they can only 
bid on our consulting work if they have that pre-qualifi-
cation. So they have to submit their qualification for 
scrutiny by a team of our staff, who are also experts in 
their area. 

We also have instituted a performance evaluation 
system. When we do evaluate the submission from the 
consultants, we take three things into account: first of all, 
the quality of the submission itself; their performance in 
the past, so they can’t just come and promise us good 
work—they have to actually have demonstrated this; and 
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of course the cost of the submission itself. So we put 
about 50% weight in that evaluation process on past 
performance. 

Mrs. Sandals: Would you be able to create a feedback 
loop in that performance evaluation where, if they’ve 
done work for you previously, you would be able to look 
at the number of change orders, the accuracy of the cost 
estimates, so you can feed that back into a future 
contract? 

Mr. Hennum: That’s correct. I want to mention that 
the Consulting Engineers of Ontario, which is sort of the 
body that encompasses these people, also recognizes that 
there is room for improvements. I have a commitment 
from them that they’re going to work closely with us to 
put additional quality control processes in place. Perhaps 
they will also introduce things like peer reviews of the 
designs and so on so we can minimize such unfortunate 
things as happened on the Hanlon Expressway. 

Mrs. Sandals: Thank you. I am pleased with that 
reassurance, that you’ve addressed that, because there 
were certainly some problems with that. 

The other question I’ve got has to do with this issue of 
routine maintenance and monitoring of contracts or 
setting the level of contracts for the level of maintenance. 
This really goes back to my days of being president of 
the Ontario Public School Boards’ Association and a 
situation I’m aware of in northeastern Ontario a few 
years back, where they had a record number of snow 
days; that is, days when they had to cancel the school 
buses. I accept that the weather is variable. It wasn’t that 
there was an ongoing blizzard or ice storm; it was just 
simply related to the fact that it had snowed overnight 
and that the plows hadn’t been sent out early enough to 
clear the roads and, because nobody had cleared the 
roads, they had to cancel school buses and therefore they 
had to cancel school. 

I’m honestly not sure whether that was a situation of 
the contract standard being set too low or whether it was 
a situation of the standard not being met. But where you 
have a situation like that, where the level of performance, 
for whatever reason, obviously isn’t getting the road 
cleared on time, what do you do about that? 

Mr. Hennum: We have performance standards in our 
maintenance contracts, both in the area of maintenance 
contracts and in the managed outsourcing contracts, 
which generally stipulate that the contractor has to be 
ready to get out of the yard, fully loaded with salt and 
with a plow in place, about 30 minutes after he gets the 
call to go out. Of course, the trick is therefore to call him 
out at the right time. In the area maintenance contracts, 
that’s done by the contractor, and our monitors are 
watching what’s going on to make sure they perform to 
standard. In our own areas, we are the people who call 
the contractors out. 

What we have done in order to operate more timely—
the deputy minister referred to our advanced road 
weather information system, which will give us pre-
warning of precipitation as well as icing on the roads and 
so on, so we can forecast the conditions and we can be 

more prepared to go out on time. This is one of the things 
that technology is helping us do in a more timely fashion. 

Mrs. Sandals: So you’ve been able to improve, not 
just in the GTA but all over the province, the reaction—
in my lay terminology—to sending the plow out when it 
starts to snow, as opposed to what was obviously happen-
ing in this case, which was, five hours after it stopped, 
we’ll think about plowing. 

Mr. Hennum: Yes. 
Mrs. Sandals: You’ve been able to put in a more 

timely response. 
Mr. Rafi: That’s absolutely the case, as Carl has 

outlined. In addition, just to give you an indication of a 
specific performance measure, as a standard of bare 
pavement achieved after winter storms that is applied to 
our contractors, in 2003-04 the bare pavement perform-
ance results were 96%. So 96% of the time they achieved 
or exceeded their requirements for bare pavement after 
winter storms. We set our standard requirements at 90%, 
so we’re pleased that they were surpassed yet again. 
There have been some fairly severe weather conditions. 
We’ve tracked this data going back from 1998 and I 
think in each and every year we’ve exceeded the 90% 
standard year over year. That tells us, as part of an earlier 
question as well, that our contractors take their require-
ments quite seriously. 

The Chair: Mr. Lalonde? 
Mr. Jean-Marc Lalonde (Glengarry–Prescott–

Russell): May I pass it on to Mr. Mauro, because he has 
to leave? 

The Chair: Sure. 
Mr. Lalonde: I’ll come back, though. I want to make 

sure that I get my question too. 
The Chair: We’re going to go to the other parties 

after Mr. Mauro. 
Mr. Bill Mauro (Thunder Bay–Atikokan): I have a 

few questions but I just want to follow up on what Mrs. 
Sandals asked. You said that you have a 94% success rate 
or compliance rate of having bare pavement after snow-
falls, but you didn’t say how long after or, if you did, I 
missed it. Anybody can get it plowed after the snowfall, 
but if it’s a week later, it’s not doing us a lot of good, is 
it? 

Mr. Hennum: That’s correct. We classify the high-
ways in terms of where they are and what traffic volumes 
there are on them. For example, we have standards for 
exactly what you’re talking about, for what we call class 
1 highways, where if traffic is greater than 10,000 
vehicles per day, the bare pavement standard is eight 
hours after the storm. 
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Mr. Mauro: What about when it’s less than 10,000 
vehicles? 

Mr. Hennum: If you’re in northern Ontario, on the 
Trans-Canada, for example, that’s a class 2 highway, 
which is between 1,500 and 10,000 vehicles per day, and 
the standard is 16 hours after the snowstorm is complete. 

Mr. Mauro: And you can justify that just because of 
lower traffic volume? If this is a safety issue, how do you 
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apply a rule like volume of traffic to a Trans-Canada 
Highway, which is the only link, the only method—no 
other options exist for people to utilize to go east-west in 
this country, and because it’s a lower traffic volume, you 
apply a different standard to it. How do we justify a 
decision like that? 

Mr. Hennum: In fact, we also have the numbers on 
what we actually achieve out there. On the class 2 
highways which I just referred to, the actual average time 
to regain bare pavement is four hours, vis-à-vis the 
standards. So we are overachieving in this case. This is 
for the very reason that you’re talking about. We are 
aware that the sooner we get the pavements bare, the 
safer the highway is. But we have to set priorities, 
because we can’t cover the whole network instantly at the 
same time. So you will find in your area that one part of 
the highway will have a very short period, and then it 
takes time to drive to the other end of the network. 

Mr. Mauro: With respect, though, in terms of setting 
priorities, each section of your highway system has 
contractors and/or publicly employed staff attached to it. 
That section is their priority, because that’s their 
responsibility contractually. So there’s no reason to 
suggest that that’s an excuse for there to be a different 
standard in terms of the amount of hours that exist before 
it has to be bare pavement, right? That’s their priority. 
That’s their job. 

Anyway, I don’t want to beat that one up. I have a few 
other questions. 

What criteria do you use to make your decisions 
around capital allocations for new construction? 

Mr. Rafi: As we mentioned, we have in develop-
ment—and hopefully we’ll execute the entire asset 
management business framework, which is our business 
process where we’ll look at the current asset valuation 
and the state of each segment. We’re in the process of 
doing segment-by-segment assessments across each and 
every— 

Mr. Mauro: I’m sorry. I didn’t mean rehabbing or 
reconstructing existing infrastructure, I meant any 
increases to the capacity of the system—so new build. 

Mr. Rafi: New build is, as I mentioned earlier, on our 
expansion priorities. We’re looking at highway traffic in 
terms of volumes. We’re looking at key economic cor-
ridors and access points to border entry areas. Those are 
all examined across the network to determine where best 
to apply expansion monies and where best to prioritize 
that in the context of how that will have the most 
economic benefit, the congestion relief benefit, in terms 
of access during critical periods in key areas of the 
province. 

Mr. Mauro: The volumes and economic benefit are 
linked. So would it be fair to assume that the capital ex-
pansion projects are going to exist where the growth in 
the province exists? 

Mr. Rafi: I would say that’s certainly an important 
factor, but not only the factor. 

Mr. Mauro: Beyond programs like SHIP and 
COMRIF, are there any long-standing perpetual agree-

ments with the feds around the maintenance or capital 
expansion works for the portion of the Trans-Canada 
highway that exists in Ontario? 

Mr. Rafi: Yes, there are two other important partner-
ships we have. One is the border infrastructure fund, 
which is about expansion in critical areas as they come to 
key junctures in the border. Windsor is an excellent 
example of that, where we have, actually, as far back as 
Tilbury, going southwest toward Windsor—to expand the 
network there. The second one is the Canada strategic 
infrastructure fund, where we’re looking at, again, 
strategic locations to apply for provincial projects for 
inspection. 

Mr. Mauro: But the Trans-Canada Highway, is that 
completely within the purview of the province to main-
tain and expand and take care of, beyond the specific 
programs that come up once in a while? 

Mr. Rafi: It is; however, Transport Canada has had a 
national highway system program in place for many 
years. So each province identifies its key corridors. In 
Ontario, it’s beyond just the Trans-Canada; we look at 
other corridors as well, and they determine based on 
kilometre ranges as to what type of funding they provide 
to each province. I guess constitutionally, if that’s part of 
your question, that responsibility rests with the province, 
but certainly there is an obligation, we feel, that the 
federal government has to assist Ontario in that regard. 

Mr. Mauro: So historically there is no long-standing 
obligation on their part for the Trans-Canada Highway. 

Mr. Rafi: Historically they have contributed to the 
building and development. 

Mr. Mauro: Understood, but it’s basically we joining 
with them on program and cost-sharing. Is that the case 
in other provinces? It’s my understanding—and I’m 
looking for some clarification—that other provinces have 
different arrangements with the federal government when 
it comes to the Trans-Canada Highway, within different 
provincial boundaries. Would you know the answer to 
that? 

Mr. Hennum: There are variations in federal invest-
ment in highway networks across Canada. You’re quite 
correct. 

Mr. Mauro: I don’t mean investment in terms of 
programs that are developed. I mean investment in terms 
of historical agreements that exist between provinces and 
the federal government for the maintenance of the Trans-
Canada Highway. Would you know? 

Mr. Rafi: Maintenance? No, I don’t believe that’s the 
case. On expansion, we watch that pretty closely to 
ensure that Ontario gets what it should have in terms of 
the network. 

Mr. Mauro: In the notes that we received there is 
some information here about the increase in costs associ-
ated with maintenance and capital works over the last 
number of years—six years, eight years, whatever the 
scope was; I forget. I was unclear when I read it as to 
what the link is for the increase in the costs. Are you 
drawing a conclusion and suggesting that the costs have 
increased when it comes to highway maintenance 
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because there has been privatization? Is it because there 
have been worse winters in the last six years or because 
we’ve done more work? What’s the suggested reason for 
the increase in costs associated with the highway system? 

Mr. Rafi: There are several changes that have taken 
place. For example, we have added approximately 11 
different requirements for our contractors to provide. In 
this current round of contractor outsourcing in our RFP 
processes, we have seen a reduction in our costs but 
added these 11 elements, not the least of which is the 
need to apply West Nile virus to still water/stagnant 
water areas throughout our network, which is a huge 
concern for us—enhanced emergency response methods. 

In addition to that, the highway network has increased 
in terms of lane kilometres. There has been expansion, 
there have been additional lanes, so there are additional 
costs associated with that. But we have actually received 
the benefit of that through our competitive tendering 
process. In addition to that, we have forgone capital 
expenditures that we would have undertaken—approx-
imately $7 million per year in equipment—because those 
costs are being passed along. 

Mr. Mauro: So you would suggest it’s cheaper now 
to provide the same level of care than it was prior to 
privatization. Is that what you’re saying? 

Mr. Rafi: Yes, and this is, I think, a controversial 
issue. It was discussed and debated in 1999 with Mr. 
McCarter’s predecessor. Our view is, we are getting 
more value for the money we spend now than we did in 
previous years. If one just applied CPI inflation from 
1999 forward, year over year, to 2003-04, you’d have to 
add $23 million alone just for keeping pace with inflation 
on that. So we feel we’ve done very well. 

Mr. Mauro: My last comment is that others have 
spoken about quantifying and checking up on the people 
who are responsible for doing the work, the management 
within MTO. I can tell you from personal experience 
that, as Ms. Sandals said earlier, when you’re travelling 
sections of northern highway, you can tell where one 
contractor stops and another one begins. The distinction 
between the quality of the work is that stark and it’s 
extremely dangerous for a lot of folks. I’m hopeful that 
what’s been raised in this audit is going to be acted on by 
your ministry and there are going to be products and 
mechanisms in place to address contractors who are not 
doing the work that they’re supposed to do. 
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The Chair: I wanted to ask a couple of supplementary 
questions with regard to what Mr. Mauro brought up, and 
that is, the federal contribution toward our new highway 
system and that kind of thing. 

I wonder, Deputy, if you would provide the committee 
with figures on their contribution toward our new capital 
construction over the past 10, maybe even 20, years with 
regard to our highway system. 

I’d also like it if you could provide the committee with 
the percentage share that Ontario is getting from the 
Canada-provincial construction—I forget the name. I 
understand it’s about 25%, whereas we have about 38% 

of the population. Again, we’re not getting our fair share. 
I said that when I was transportation minister and I 
continue to support the present government’s position in 
getting a fair share of programs as we go forward. I think 
you left the impression that we were getting our fair 
share under that agreement and that there weren’t other 
programs in other provinces. 

When we were in Fredericton this summer, I met in 
New Brunswick by happenstance with some Ontario 
contractors who were bidding on four-laning the Trans-
Canada Highway from Edmundston down to Fredericton. 
I’m aware that there were great gobs of federal money 
going into that four-laning project, both past and into the 
future. 

I think it’s important that we keep our eyes on that. 
When I was the minister, the federal government gave $6 
million out of $1 billion of construction to the province 
of Ontario, whereas they were pouring huge amounts of 
money into other provinces across this country. For us to 
call the Trans-Canada Highway the Trans-Canada High-
way when the province of Ontario is spending all the 
money on it, I just don’t think is fair. I think the people 
out there have the idea that the federal government is 
coming to the table with regard to building the Trans-
Canada Highway. They have in the long-term past, but 
they sure weren’t doing anything when we four-laned the 
417 from Ottawa out to Arnprior, for instance, which was 
a significant project. Carl, I don’t know the total number 
on that, but it was well over $100 million. They may 
have come to the table very late, in the last phases of it, 
but for that kind of a project, for instance, not only are 
they not giving money for the north, they’re not giving 
money anywhere on the Trans-Canada Highway. 

It’s important for us to keep these numbers out there 
so that people understand that we aren’t getting our fair 
share, not only with regard to other programs, but also in 
terms of construction. 

Mrs. Sandals: Norm, may I bail in? 
Having been on the same trip to Fredericton, I concur 

with Norm totally. When you’re flying into the airport, 
you seem to follow along the same path as the Trans-
Canada. I actually noted that that highway is four-laned 
through the middle of nowhere, and it would be inter-
esting to know how this got paid for. I suspect you’re 
right, that the federal government four-laned it through a 
vast expanse of bush. So I concur with your observations 
totally. 

The Chair: I think it’s really important in this debate 
that we are now having in Canada and in Ontario that 
we’ve got to demand of the federal government that they 
step up to the table. 

Mr. Rafi: If you’ll allow us, we will get that infor-
mation after today. We don’t have the federal contribu-
tions over the last 20 years here, and the percentage share 
for Ontario for the various programs, not just the Canada 
strategic infrastructure but the border infrastructure, the 
strategic highway infrastructure. 

But I would like to be clear on the record that if I did 
say that, then I misspoke myself. I didn’t mean to suggest 
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that Ontario feels—or I feel, for that matter—that we 
have received the adequate amount of funding that we 
should get based on highway kilometres, based on 
percentage use, based on economic activity. By no 
stretch is that the case, in my opinion and, I dare say, in 
my colleagues’ across all sectors that Ontario interacts 
with the federal government. 

My reference to the federal government’s role in 
maintenance, I believe it was—it is my understanding 
that they do not provide any maintenance activity in any 
region of the country. As far as the New Brunswick 
example goes, it’s a lovely highway for a very concen-
trated number of individuals to travel, and I would only 
echo and agree with, I think, probably all members that 
Ontario could do a lot better from the federal government 
in that regard. So I just want to be certain that my 
comments were reflected appropriately, that I didn’t 
misspeak myself. 

The Chair: I think the area where confusion may 
have arisen was when Mr. Mauro was asking you about 
the Trans-Canada Highway. They have contributed in the 
past to the Trans-Canada, but it’s a distant past. 

Mr. Rafi: Oh, yes, original build. 
The Chair: In terms of the total costs associated with 

it, it’s becoming a smaller and smaller percentage as we 
go forward in the history, as we improve the Trans-Can-
ada Highway in different sections. They’re not contribut-
ing, or weren’t contributing, to the four-laning of High-
way 69 up to Sudbury. I think they may have kicked in 
more recently on that one. In my view, you can’t present 
these figures and say they’re giving $50 million when 
we’re talking billions of dollars. It’s a very, very small 
percentage of the total. 

Mr. Rafi: I think we have a strong reputation in 
Ottawa for our concerns in that regard. 

Mrs. Munro: I wanted to ask a couple of questions, 
and you may appreciate my interest in asking. 

With regard to the issue of gross vehicle weight of 
trucks, in the auditor’s report he refers to the fact that it is 
estimated that there is, he suggests, $300 million of 
avoidable damage. Obviously, I know about the phasing 
in of the vehicle weight and dimension project, but I 
wondered if at this point you are able to give us a sense 
of the effectiveness of those initial phases 1 and 2 in 
terms of being able to suggest that it is having a bene-
ficial impact on those kinds of costs. 

Mr. Rafi: The ability to ultimately declare victory on 
the $300 million will really be a function of the 
industry’s migration to new equipment and what we’re 
calling the safe, productive and infrastructure-friendly 
equipment that they will be obliged to have on Ontario 
roads. In some cases, that may take 10 to 15 years as they 
phase out and grandfather existing production and equip-
ment and as they build new equipment or equip their 
trucks with active axles, as opposed to fixed or liftable 
axles. From your experience, you know probably more 
about that than I do. So, to be perfectly up front about it, 
it won’t be until the end of the fourth phase of our 

vehicle weights and dimensions project. We are 
executing the third phase this year. 

To give you an example, the number of lift-axles-
equipped vehicles in each project phase—in the third 
phase it will be about 19,500 trailers. This is the most 
heavily populated stage, if I can call it that, and then that 
drops to 10,000 trucks in phase 4. We’re very confident 
that by the end of phase 4, we will have achieved a 
significant reduction in degradation and impact on the 
infrastructure, not just provincially but municipally as 
well, because the radius turns in municipal streets and 
arterial roads really take the lion’s share of that damage. 
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Mrs. Munro: My second question has to do with a 
related topic, in that there are some issues raised around 
the bridges in the province. I wondered if you could tell 
us, what is the lifespan of a bridge? 

Mr. Rafi: I’ll let the most experienced transportation 
engineer in Ontario address that. 

Mr. Hennum: The— 
The Chair: Could I just interrupt here? Mr. Hennum, 

since I left the ministry, have you now become the chief 
engineer? 

Mr. Hennum: I never made that claim, at least not 
when you were there. 

Probably about 60 to 70 years is the average lifespan, 
but that means you have to look after it in the meantime, 
of course. There is constant rehabilitation and main-
tenance that is required to achieve that kind of lifespan, 
but that’s in general. I have to preface that; it depends on 
the type of bridge, because we are using all kinds of 
bridge material these days. We have just received awards 
actually for using timber structures in northern Ontario in 
quite innovative ways, which both reduces costs and fits 
well into the environment in which they are built. 

Mrs. Munro: That was really why I wanted to ask the 
question, simply because of the complexity. Obviously 
there’s going to be a huge variation in terms of what is an 
average bridge lifespan. The challenge of rehabilitation is 
one the auditor identified. I think we have numbers here 
that refer to the number of bridges that are provincial 
bridges and the number that are municipal bridges. I 
wondered if you could just comment briefly on the 
possible role of the ministry in terms of the oversight of 
this rehabilitation process. 

Mr. Rafi: In terms of bridge management and any 
necessary maintenance or rehabilitation, as I think the 
auditor pointed out, as you suggest—I guess our bridge 
management system contains a high degree of complete 
and accurate information, but he has made some 
suggestions about notification flags in terms of inspection 
cycles. We’re certainly going to execute that. 

As referenced in my remarks, the bridge management 
system we have in place is actually a fairly sophisticated 
and effective model that’s being deployed and used by 
other jurisdictions in the country. As well, we have 
undertaken some changes to make sure we do have more 
complete and accurate bridge condition information in 
place, and that is the requirement to inspect every two 
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years. The data is then loaded on an annual basis into the 
system so it can be effectively used. Obviously, experi-
enced professional engineers are doing the inspections. 

We have updated our inspection manual and the 
structural manual and we’ve added training and refresher 
courses for staff. But we’ve also applied the bridge 
management system and given it to the Ontario Good 
Roads Association so they can educate municipalities and 
use this bridge management system for their own main-
tenance inspection requirements, both legislatively and in 
a responsible manner, for all bridges and roads that they 
have control over as well. 

The Chair: Mr. Prue, do you have some questions? 
Mr. Prue: Yes, I have two separate questions. The 

first one relates to new construction maintenance, new 
construction materials. I was heartened over the last 
number of years to see that, instead of using aggregates, 
digging up more hills and vales in Ontario and putting 
more stuff in the dumps, you’re starting to use old tires, 
glass, old concrete in the roads. How much of that is 
being used, or how much are you relying on the old 
materials? 

Mr. Hennum: I do not have the actual quantities 
available for you—I can provide you with that if you’re 
interested—but it’s a fairly moderate amount at this stage 
of the game. We use it basically in side-slope fills and 
that sort of thing. I will be able to provide you the 
quantities, if you wish. 

Mr. Prue: Is it environmentally possible that instead 
of putting glass in landfills it could all be used on road 
construction? 

Mr. Hennum: It has the potential for it, yes. 
Mr. Prue: Is it possible that, instead of having huge 

tire dumps like the one that was on fire for years in 
Hamilton, the tires could be ground up and used in road 
construction? And, if all that’s possible, why aren’t we 
doing it? 

Mr. Hennum: I think the jury is still out on whether 
that is a good idea or not. It depends, again, on the 
quantities, of course. For example, what do you do when 
you rehabilitate, have to reconstruct or you have a whole 
bunch of rubber that you have to dispose of in some way? 
It depends on the types of roads as well, of course. Some 
municipalities have used it quite a bit on lower-volume 
roads. We have not used rubber in the pavements to any 
great extent, but we have used it in the fills outside the 
pavement platform. 

Mr. Prue: I noticed, and I thought it was really 
amazing, that when they tore down old Terminal 1 at 
Toronto airport they used all of the old concrete. They 
never took any of it away. They used it in the construc-
tion of the new building. Can we do the same kind of 
thing with our old concrete in our roads or our bridges or 
anything else? 

Mr. Hennum: We do crush it and use it for certain 
purposes. We don’t have, quite frankly, that many con-
crete roads. We haven’t built concrete roads for quite 
some time. It’s just starting to be incorporated into our 
tenders right now. There aren’t the huge quantities, and 

we do try to use it wherever we can. Certainly, our ob-
jective is to recycle as much as possible what we have in 
the right-of-way. That’s an objective, and a very com-
mendable objective as well, I think. 

Mr. Prue: My second related question: There is an 
enforcement program—congratulations on that—for go-
ing after trucks and trailers that are overloaded, because 
we know that that causes tremendous damage to the 
roads in Ontario. They overload them; it causes stress on 
the roads; they break down faster. So we go out and en-
force that. But the auditor has noted that you do not col-
lect or analyze any of the data on how many convictions 
are made. Why don’t you do that—how much money, 
why the convictions are made? Why don’t you do that? 

Mr. Rafi: Actually, I wouldn’t say we don’t analyze 
the data; in fact, we have a commercial vehicle operator 
record that is for carriers—in other words, the companies 
themselves—and for drivers. There is a system of points 
applied. All charges are instituted on that system. Then, 
when you hit a certain threshold, through a stepped 
escalation process ultimately you can be taken out of 
business for too many collisions or weight violations, 
either moving or non-moving. We also have the most 
stringent requirements, certainly in Canada, and one of 
the more stringent requirements in North America, for 
both weight and moving violations on our carriers. 

To your specific question, we have recently instituted 
what we call roadside data capture, an electronic system 
we’ll be implementing this summer that will give a better 
monitoring and removal of high-risk offenders, by 
knowing that if you’re overloaded in Cornwall and one of 
our enforcement officers stops you, that’s real-time 
information to the officer in London as you come through 
that area as well. So we can flag individual vehicles to 
make sure that we’re doing it in a more effective manner 
than hoping that we get them into the scale at the right 
time when they are overloaded. That’s one area. 
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The second area is that we’re working with the actual 
shippers and the aggregate companies that actually load 
these trucks. It’s always a challenge for the driver, 
because the impact on the driver is that they’ll get 
somebody else to haul the goods. We’re trying to work 
with that industry by doing spot audits and ensuring that 
when they’re loading vehicles and they’re giving them 
the load tickets, those vehicles are leaving their areas 
properly loaded so they’re not damaging the infra-
structure. So I think we’re undertaking a few tools that 
are available to us and using the court system, which we 
can’t control, in the best manner possible. 

Mr. Prue: We need higher fines. 
Mr. Rafi: I’m not sure that just increasing the fines is 

the best deterrent, in my experience. I think that the ap-
propriate use of fines and education will be there. Courts 
sometimes are reluctant to apply certain liability charges 
unless and until there is strict proof. So absolute versus 
strict liability offences, meaning that if something 
happens you’re simply convicted and you pay a fine or 
worse, are very difficult for courts to accept. We’ve had 
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some success, and I dare say the only jurisdiction in 
Canada that has had success with absolute liability is 
Ontario. So it’s not just one instrument; it’s a series of 
things that we’ve applied. 

Mr. Prue: Ontario is now a North American leader in 
car production. It seems to be that the cars keep getting 
bigger and bigger. I see these Escalades and other huge, 
huge tanks on the road, like Hummers. Should Ontario be 
doing something about reducing the weight and size of 
the cars in order to assist our road maintenance? They 
have to be more harmful to the roads than small vehicles; 
they have to be. 

Mr. Rafi: I don’t have the technical specifications on 
that. It may sound like I’m passing this off to the federal 
government, but it is in their purview to determine the 
various dimensions, sizes and safety aspects of vehicles 
in Canada. 

Mr. Prue: What effect are studded tires going to have 
on northern Ontario? That has been discussed in the 
Legislature this last couple of weeks. What effect is 
allowing studded tires in northern Ontario going to have 
on road maintenance across half of Ontario? 

Mr. Rafi: I think it’s far too early to be able to com-
ment on that. We’ve just allowed for the institution of 
studded tires and a certain type of stud in specific 
locations in the north, as you identify. We’ve looked at 
this from a road safety point of view as well. Our hope is 
that it will bring additional safety, especially in wet ice 
conditions, which are certainly more prevalent in the 
north than they are in the southern parts of Ontario. 

Mr. Prue: It’s going to help in terms of safety, and no 
one will deny that. But in terms of maintenance, if it 
starts tearing up the roads and costing tens of millions of 
dollars in resurfacing—are you going to be monitoring 
this? 

Mr. Rafi: Absolutely, yes, we’re going to be monitor-
ing. But it’s purely speculative to put a figure on that or 
to even assume that it will have a deleterious impact on 
maintenance. It’s too early for us to be able to say that. 
But we will be monitoring it. 

Mr. Lalonde: Just to carry on with the question that 
was brought forward by Mr. Mauro, in the auditor’s 
report on page 335, we have a table, “Highway Main-
tenance Expenditures.” We know that we have privatized 
a lot of those maintenance contracts. What is the per-
centage of the maintenance contracts that have been 
privatized? Do we have the percentage? 

Mr. Hennum: We’re 100% outsourced in mainten-
ance. All the work is done by contractors, for all intents 
and purposes. 

Mr. Lalonde: That resulted in how much staff reduc-
tion? Approximately how many fewer staff do we have? 

Mr. Hennum: We currently have about 800 main-
tenance staff, compared with about 2,400 before, so it’s 
down to about a third. 

Mr. Lalonde: About 1,200 less? When I’m looking at 
this, way back in 1996-97, we had 56,000 lane kilometres 
and now we’re down to 46,000. The cost per kilometre 
for maintenance was $3,900 and now it’s up to $5,300. 

Why is there a higher cost per kilometre at the present 
time? 

Mr. Hennum: A couple of things contribute to that. 
First of all, we had a bigger network before, as you 
pointed out, but we have retained all the high-cost high-
ways, so the average cost per kilometre will go up. But 
the main reason is reflected in the total highway cost 
numbers, higher up in your table there, which the deputy 
minister addressed a little earlier, indicating that there is 
inflation in those figures. They also reflect a number of 
additions that we have made to how we do maintenance, 
such as technology in a number of areas and incorpor-
ating new regulations for traffic control when they do 
work on the highways, for example. If you add all those 
additions up, you will probably reach around $20 million 
on an annual basis for all costs for operating and main-
taining these new methods. Overall, you have inflation 
and you have enhancements to the way we are doing our 
business. 

Mr. Lalonde: In other words, it has been a cost saving 
to the taxpayers, having awarded the maintenance con-
tract to the private sector. It is a cost saving. Thank you. 
That answers the question. 

The Chair: For Hansard’s sake, you said yes. 
Mr. Hennum: We believe that is the case. We know 

that is the case. 
The Chair: Could I ask some questions with regard to 

municipal bridges? The auditor talked about ensuring that 
municipalities were in fact undertaking inspections and 
that you were implementing a system to ensure that 
municipalities were undertaking these inspections. Is that 
correct? I believe those were in your opening remarks. 

Mr. Rafi: Yes, you are correct. The auditor does say 
that we should obtain adequate assurance that local 
governments have appropriate systems and procedures in 
place. 

The Chair: As I also understand from your remarks 
and from what the auditor said, you bear no respon-
sibility in terms of ensuring that a municipal bridge is up 
to standard at this time. I’m hesitant in terms of leaving 
the issue up in the air as to whose responsibility the 
bridge is, and the safety of the bridge. In my under-
standing, it’s a municipality’s responsibility to ensure 
that the bridge is safe to go over. 

Mr. Rafi: In fact, under legislation, that is their 
responsibility, and always has been. 
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The Chair: OK. So then do you divide the respon-
sibility between the ministry, the government of Ontario 
and the municipality if a municipal bridge falls down and 
there is injury or harm or whatever? How are we going to 
ensure that doesn’t happen without taking the full 
responsibility of control of the bridge? 

Mr. Rafi: We feel we’ve done several recent import-
ant measures, not the least of which is the bridge 
management system and the Ontario structure inspection 
manual. We’ve provided both the system and the manual 
both through education and free of charge to municipal-
ities for them to use, because varying municipalities with 
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varying sizes may not be able to afford the technology 
that helps them to inspect and monitor bridges and keep 
their inventory updated and current. 

In addition to that, the OSTAR fund that you would be 
familiar with, as well as the most recent COMRIF fund, 
provide for municipal monies through application by 
municipalities for bridge maintenance, road maintenance 
and road enhancements. These are municipalities that are 
much smaller and perhaps wouldn’t have the resources 
themselves, or if they did, they would have to take sev-
eral years to build those resources in their reserves. 

Lastly, our work with the Ontario Good Roads Associ-
ation, which represents over 90% of the municipalities, 
has transmitted this information across all municipalities 
that are interested. In the COMRIF round of applications, 
I can tell you that over 67% of the municipalities that 
applied had some form of bridge inspection and asset 
management plans already in place, and COMRIF can 
help to supplement and improve on those. 

We’ve also tried to pressure and work with the federal 
government to ensure that a portion of those COMRIF 
program funds are allocated to the development of asset 
management capacity in municipalities. So we haven’t 
said, “That’s your legislative responsibility,” and turned 
our backs or walked away from them whatsoever. In fact, 
given our leadership role in the country, we’ve worked 
with municipalities and will continue to do so. We take 
that responsibility seriously. 

The Chair: I guess my real concern here is how we’re 
going to help municipalities fix the problem. We’ve 
talked about the downloading of some of our provincial 
highways, but they basically landed on county govern-
ment shoulders, and county governments are better able 
to meet the challenge perhaps than the lower-tier muni-
cipalities. 

Some of the lower-tier municipalities have minimal 
taxing power. I think Lanark Highlands, which I repre-
sent, has 45 bridges or something like that in this lower-
tier municipality. Many of the roads aren’t paved. They 
still have crown land in their municipality. Notwith-
standing that we may get a report that they have 
inspected or not inspected, from what I’m hearing, you’re 
not looking at the inspection report; you’re just asking 
them if they’ve inspected. Is that correct? 

Mr. Rafi: No, we’re giving them the tools actually to 
ensure that they can inspect, that they have an asset 
management plan. In fact, at the county level in Lanark, 
I’m pleased to say that they do have an asset manage-
ment plan in place that monitors their bridge and road 
network so they can do what we’re trying to do, which is 
to do early rehabilitation and maintenance so that their 
costs don’t balloon later on. We have taken several tools 
to help them in that regard. 

The Chair: County is one thing and the local munici-
pality is another. It’s mentioned your assessment is the 
BCI. You use an assessment— 

Mr. Rafi: Bridge condition index. 
The Chair: Yes. Are the municipalities and the 

counties doing that as well? 

Mr. Rafi: Some are, very much so. As you men-
tioned, the larger ones that have a very sophisticated 
approach, or a relatively sophisticated approach, will 
probably be applying that. Others are using perhaps more 
basic asset management tools. As they improve and get 
more comfortable with the bridge management system, 
they too will be able to apply those indices as necessary. 

The Chair: The ministry had a bridge over the Mon-
treal River. I don’t know whether it totally collapsed or 
partially collapsed, actually. Notwithstanding the welfare 
or the taxing power and the budget of MTO, that was 
very much a latent defect that probably would not have 
been revealed on an inspection. But we’ve got many 
thousands of bridges that are the responsibility of 
counties and municipalities. At some point in time the 
province, or the province and the feds, is going to have to 
jump in and deal with this particular problem. I just 
wonder whether or not we should be, at this time, trying 
to establish where the priorities are going to be when we 
jump in. 

For instance, in the county of Renfrew they have a 
bridge that, as I understand it, should be replaced in the 
not-too-distant future. In order for them to do that, it’s 
going to take up a huge amount of the county’s budget. 
Well, they’re not going to be able to do that, so senior 
governments are going to have to come to their rescue. 

Should we not, at this point in time, be trying to 
manage into the future and say to local governments, to 
county governments, “You should be on this BCI model, 
and here’s some money to help you do it”? 

Mr. Rafi: With respect, I think that’s exactly what we 
are doing. Not only have we alleviated their need to 
spend on developing their own technology so they have 
the technology that allows them to apply that indice to 
their bridge structures, but we’ve provided funding, 
through OSTAR previously and currently COMRIF, so 
that when they prioritize that a particular bridge needs or 
bridges need rehabilitation, they make that application to 
those funds. Of the 350 applications that have been 
received this year, 62 are for bridge projects, and they are 
the priorities of that community, as distinct from perhaps 
a road priority, as distinct from perhaps some other 
infrastructure priority. 

I think both the federal and Ontario governments, and 
especially the Ontario government, are trying to provide 
that assistance in both expertise and technology, which 
equals money, and in funds themselves to help those 
critical infrastructures. 

Mr. Zimmer: Returning to a favourite topic of mine, 
and that’s information technology and computer systems 
and so on: Over the last year and a half that I’ve been on 
this committee, various ministries have come forward, 
and one of the ongoing themes is the difficulty of incur-
porating new technology and getting new technology set 
up—the computer systems, and everybody speaking to 
everybody electronically and that sort of thing. We’ve 
heard stories ranging from horror to the comical about 
how information management systems have tripped up 
the best intentions and the best plans. 
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I take it, with your new asset management program, 
that a component of it is the latest information technol-
ogy. How confident are you that you’ll meet the chal-
lenges of getting the right information systems in place 
and getting it all talking to whom it should be talking to 
and so on? We’ve heard, as I’ve said, horror stories and 
comical stories on how the best-laid plans of folks have 
gone wrong in this regard. 

Mr. Rafi: As you’ve alluded to, the success of any 
execution of information technology is not just the pur-
chasing of the technology but it’s actually the business 
process changes that go with effective implementation, 
so that you can both change the way you do business to 
harness the benefits of technology and then also apply 
that to make smarter, more informed and more effective 
decisions. 

We can say with great confidence that we’re going to 
have success, because we’ve pilot-tested this technology 
in our vehicles, the electronic diaries, the automatic 
vehicle locations systems. It’s Internet-based now. Our 
supervisory and management staff have the ability to go 
to our Web site and an Internet site to determine and find 
out in real time where trucks are on the network. We’re 
testing that in eastern region and are deploying that. 
We’re deploying touch-screen technology in our vehicles 
so they can take, as the auditor quite rightly identified, 
electronic diaries so that you don’t have these manual 
reports used in the past, because you can’t then deploy 
that information and look for trends and look for 
analysis—to your point about management information 
and effective decisions. So we’ve done it incrementally 

because we wanted to get it right, and I think we’re on 
that path. 

Mr. Zimmer: To the extent that a lot of this work is 
contracted out, what’s the plan for getting the folks it’s 
contracted out to plugged into the technology systems? 

Mr. Hennum: We already have provisions in the 
contracts for this to take place. They sign off on that 
when they actually accept the assignments. Of course, 
some of these things are not yet fully developed, but 
indeed the contracts allow for us to introduce this into 
their operations as well. So we have looked a little bit 
forward to make sure we don’t get locked out in that 
respect. 

Mr. Zimmer: I wish you the best of luck, and I look 
forward to the conversation next year on how the 
management information technology systems panned out. 

The Chair: Do we have any other questions? 
Mrs. Munro: Actually, it’s not a question. I just 

wanted to comment that Mr. Prue asked about the ques-
tion of sanctions for the overweight and things like that, 
and simply put on the record that in my experience the 
individual truckers have extreme respect for the authority 
and the expertise of the people who manage the weigh 
stations. 

The Chair: Thank you very much. We appreciate 
your coming here. Your clarity and directness have 
resulted in yours being the briefest questioning session so 
far this year. When we call you back next year, I hope 
it’s even briefer. That’s not a promise. 

Mr. Rafi: So do we, Chair. Thank you for your time. 
The committee adjourned at 1123. 
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